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Stories in this newsletter: 

Elida Build Update 

To the left is a picture of the lot where we will soon be building in Elida.  The Board of 
Directors has now approved this build.   In addition, the Family Selection Committee has 
approved our new partner family.  We will be able to release that information very soon.  
Thus, we will be able to provide a build schedule for the house in the near future.  Please 
go to the website (www.habitatlima.org)  to check out these details.  You can then sign up 
to volunteer and to donate toward this house.  Build days will occur on most Saturdays.  
We will not only need construction workers, but also people to help feed our volunteers.  
We hope you will be a part of this wonderful process—providing decent, affordable 
housing for this family through the generosity of good people in the area.  

 

Companies, Clubs & Church Connections 

Connections are important for our Habitat affiliate.  We are an organization that counts on 
volunteers, churches, clubs and businesses to help fulfill our mission.  The Lima 
community and beyond is very big-hearted and looking to help make our area a better 
place.  We have connected with service clubs like Rotary, Lions Club, Sertoma Club, Lima 
Chamber, with numerous churches, many businesses, and more.  An example is the 
Bluffton area Methodist churches who just held a “Fill the Truck Day” where people from 
the community could bring household donations to fill the ReStore truck.  Many places 
have provided food or supplies for our builds and projects or allowed us to speak at their 
events and meetings.  Please help us continue to get the good word out about Habitat for 
Humanity.  You can connect with us through our website or by phone or email.  

 

Donations Needed Now 

More than ever, we need your donations now.  With the new build approaching, we must 
dip into our reserves to lay out the initial costs of the home.  Might you help us with that?  
There are many ways you can donate.  You could become a sustaining member of the Lima 
Area Habitat for Humanity, giving monthly or yearly.  Our sustaining club name has 
recently changed names from “Club 1000” to “No Place Like Home Club”.  It still allows 
you to give at various levels.  You can also donate directly to our build by purchasing a 
square foot of house for every $62 you give.  In addition, you can donate to our Habitat 
affiliate when you purchase items online.  This can be easily done with Amazon Smile 
(smile.amazon.com) and Giving Assistant (details on our website).  All these options can 
be found at www.habitatlima.org/donate/ .  Please give generously. 

 

Volunteer Needs & News 

With our monthly ReStore “Tailgate” meetings, we announce a  Volunteer of the month.  
See our most recent recipients on our website.  We continue to look for groups to provide a 
meal for the approximately 30 volunteers that meet the last Friday of every month.  If you 
are interested in volunteering for any part of our affiliate (ReStore work, providing food 
for our volunteers, serving on a committee, helping with our next build, etc.), please fill 
out a volunteer form at www.habitatlima.org/volunteer/volunteer-interest-form.html or 
call us.  Whatever you are able to offer will be a gift to us, and especially a gift to those 
needing affordable, decent housing.   

 

 
Our mission 
Seeking to put God’s love into action, Habitat for Humanity brings people together to build homes, communities and hope. 
  
Our vision 
A world where everyone has a decent place to live 
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